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January 6, 1995

Dear Minister:

RE: Canada Health Act

The Canada Health Act has been in force now for just over a decade. The principles set out in the 
Act (public administration, comprehensiveness, universality, portability and accessibility) continue 
to enjoy the support of all provincial and territorial governments. This support is shared by the vast 
majority of Canadians. At a time when there is concern about the potential erosion of the publicly 
funded and publicly administered health care system, it is vital to safeguard these principles.

As was evident and a concern to many of us at the recent Halifax meeting, a trend toward 
divergent interpretations of the Act is developing. While I will deal with other issues at the end of 
this letter, my primary concern is with private clinics and facility fees. The issue of private clinics is 
not new to us as Ministers of Health; it formed an important part of our discussions in Halifax last 
year. For reasons I will set out below, I am convinced that the growth of a second tier of health 
care facilities providing medically necessary services that operate, totally or in large part, outside 
the publicly funded and publicly administered system, presents a serious threat to Canada's 
health care system.

Specifically, and most immediately, I believe the facility fees charged by private clinics for 
medically necessary services are a major problem which must be dealt with firmly. It is my 
position that such fees constitute user charges and, as such, contravene the principle of 
accessibility set out in the Canada Health Act.

While there is no definition of facility fees in federal or most provincial legislation, the term, 
generally speaking, refers to amounts charged for non-physician (or "hospital") services provided 
at clinics and not reimbursed by the province. Where these fees are charged for medically 
necessary services in clinics which receive funding for these services under a provincial health 
insurance plan, they constitute a financial barrier to access. As a result, they violate the user 
charge provision of the Act (section 19).

Facility fees are objectionable because they impede access to medically necessary services. 



Moreover, when clinics which receive public funds for medically necessary services also charge 
facility fees, people who can afford the fees are being directly subsidized by all other Canadians. 
This subsidization of two-tier health care is unacceptable.

The formal basis for my position on facility fees is twofold. The first is a matter of policy. In the 
context of contemporary health care delivery, an interpretation which permits facility fees for 
medically necessary services so long as the provincial health insurance plan covers physician 
fees runs counter to the spirit and intent of the Act. While the appropriate provision of many 
physician services at one time required an overnight stay in a hospital, advances in medical 
technology and the trend toward providing medical services in more accessible settings has made 
it possible to offer a wide range of medical procedures on an out-patient basis or outside of full-
service hospitals. The accessibility criterion in the Act, of which the user charge provision is just a 
specific example, was clearly intended to ensure that Canadian residents receive all medically 
necessary care without financial or other barriers and regardless of venue. It must continue to 
mean that as the nature of medical practice evolves.

Second, as a matter of legal interpretation, the definition of "hospital" set out in the Act includes 
any facility which provides acute, rehabilitative or chronic care. This definition covers those health 
care facilities known as "clinics." As a matter of both policy and legal interpretation, therefore, 
where a provincial plan pays the physician fee for a medically necessary service delivered at a 
clinic, it must also pay for the related hospital services provided or face deductions for user 
charges.

I recognize that this interpretation will necessitate some changes in provinces where clinics 
currently charge facility fees for medically necessary services. As I do not wish to cause undue 
hardship to those provinces, I will commence enforcement of this interpretation as of October 15, 
1995. This will allow the provinces the time to put into place the necessary legislative or regulatory 
framework. As of October 15, 1995, I will proceed to deduct from transfer payments any amounts 
charged for facility fees in respect of medically necessary services, as mandated by section 20 of 
the Canada Health Act. I believe this provides a reasonable transition period, given that all 
provinces have been aware of my concerns with respect to private clinics for some time, and 
given the promising headway already made by the Federal/Provincial/Territorial Advisory 
Committee on Health Services, which has been working for some time now on the issue of private 
clinics.

I want to make it clear that my intent is not to preclude the use of clinics to provide medically 
necessary services. I realize that in many situations they are a cost-effective way to deliver 
services, often in a technologically advanced manner. However, it is my intention to ensure that 
medically necessary services are provided on uniform terms and conditions, wherever they are 
offered. The principles of the Canada Health Act are supple enough to accommodate the 
evolution of medical science and of health care delivery. This evolution must not lead, however, to 
a two-tier system of health care.

I indicated earlier in this letter that, while user charges for medically necessary services are my 
most immediate concern, I am also concerned about the more general issues raised by the 
proliferation of private clinics. In particular, I am concerned about their potential to restrict access 
by Canadian residents to medically necessary services by eroding our publicly funded system. 
These concerns were reflected in the policy statement which resulted from the Halifax meeting. 
Ministers of Health present, with the exception of the Alberta Minister, agreed to:

take whatever steps are required to regulate the development of private clinics in Canada, 
and to maintain a high quality, publicly funded medicare system.

Private clinics raise several concerns for the federal government, concerns which provinces 
share. These relate to:



– weakened public support for the tax funded and publicly administered system;

– the diminished ability of governments to control costs once they have shifted from the 
public to the private sector;

– the possibility, supported by the experience of other jurisdictions, that private facilities will 
concentrate on easy procedures, leaving public facilities to handle more complicated, costly 
cases; and

– the ability of private facilities to offer financial incentives to health care providers that could 
draw them away from the public system – resources may also be devoted to features which 
attract consumers, without in any way contributing to the quality of care.

The only way to deal effectively with these concerns is to regulate the operation of private clinics.

I now call on Ministers in provinces which have not already done so to introduce regulatory 
frameworks to govern the operation of private clinics. I would emphasize that, while my immediate 
concern is the elimination of user charges, it is equally important that these regulatory frameworks 
be put in place to ensure reasonable access to medically necessary services and to support the 
viability of the publicly funded and administered system in the future. I do not feel the 
implementation of such frameworks should be long delayed.

I welcome any questions you may have with respect to my position on private clinics and facility 
fees. My officials are willing to meet with yours at any time to discuss these matters. I believe that 
our officials need to focus their attention, in the coming weeks, on the broader concerns about 
private clinics referred to above.

As I mentioned at the beginning of this letter, divergent interpretations of the Canada Health Act 
apply to a number of other practices. It is always my preference that matters of interpretation of 
the Act be resolved by finding a Federal/Provincial/Territorial consensus consistent with its 
fundamental principles. I have therefore encouraged F/P/T consultations in all cases where there 
are disagreements. In situations such as out-of-province or out-of-country coverage, I remain 
committed to following through on these consultative processes as long as they continue to 
promise a satisfactory conclusion in a reasonable time.

In closing, I would like to quote Mr. Justice Emmett M. Hall. In 1980, he reminded us:

"we, as a society, are aware that the trauma of illness, the pain of surgery, the slow decline 
to death, are burdens enough for the human being to bear without the added burden of 
medical or hospital bills penalizing the patient at the moment of vulnerability."

I trust that, mindful of these words, we will continue to work together to ensure the survival, and 
renewal, of what is perhaps our finest social project.

As the issues addressed in this letter are of great concern to Canadians, I intend to make this 
letter publicly available once all provincial Health Ministers have received it.

Yours sincerely,

Diane Marleau
Minister of Health
 

 



Letter sent on June 18, 1985 to all provincial and territorial Ministers of Health (except 
the Minister for Quebec, who received an equivalent letter in French on July 15, 1985) 

by the Honourable Jake Epp, Federal Minister of Health and Welfare.
 

June 18, 1985

Dear Minister:

Having consulted with all provincial and territorial Ministers of Health over the past several 
months, both individually and at the meeting in Winnipeg on May 16 and 17, I would like to 
confirm for you my intentions regarding the interpretation and implementation of the Canada 
Health Act. I would particularly appreciate if you could provide me with a written indication of your 
views on the attached proposals for regulations in order that I may act to have these officially put 
in place as soon as conveniently possible. Also, I will write to you further with regard to the 
material I will need to prepare the required annual report to Parliament.

As indicated at our meeting in Winnipeg, I intend to honour and respect provincial jurisdiction and 
authority in matters pertaining to health and the provision of health care services. I am persuaded, 
by conviction and experience, that more can be achieved through harmony and collaboration than 
through discord and confrontation.

With regard to the Canada Health Act, I can only conclude from our discussions that we together 
share a public trust and are mutually and equally committed to the maintenance and improvement 
of a universal, comprehensive, accessible and portable health insurance system, operated under 
public auspices for the benefit of all residents of Canada.

Our discussions have reinforced my belief that you require sufficient flexibility and administrative 
versatility to operate and administer your health care insurance plans. You know far better than I 
ever can, the needs and priori-ties of your residents, in light of geographic and economic 
considerations. Moreover, it is essential that provinces have the freedom to exercise their primary 
responsibility for the provision of personal health care services.

At the same time, I have come away from our discussions sensing a desire to sustain a positive 
federal involvement and role – both financial and otherwise – to support and assist provinces in 
their efforts dedicated to the fundamental objectives of the health care system: protecting, 
promoting and restoring the physical and mental well-being of Canadians. As a group, provincial/
territorial Health Ministers accept a co-operative partnership with the federal government based 
primarily on the contributions it authorizes for purposes of providing insured and extended health 
care services.

I might also say that the Canada Health Act does not respond to challenges facing the health care 
system. I look forward to working collaboratively with you as we address challenges such as 
rapidly advancing medical technology and an aging population and strive to develop health 
promotion strategies and health care delivery alternatives.

Returning to the immediate challenge of implementing the Canada Health Act, I want to set forth 
some reasonably comprehensive statements of federal policy intent, beginning with each of the 
criteria contained in the Act.
  
Public Administration

This criterion is generally accepted. The intent is that the provincial health care insurance plans 
be administered by a public authority, accountable to the provincial government for decision-
making on benefit levels and services, and whose records and accounts are publicly audited.

Comprehensiveness



The intent of the Canada Health Act is neither to expand nor contract the range of insured 
services covered under previous federal legislation. The range of insured services encompasses 
medically necessary hospital care, physician services and surgical-dental services which require a 
hospital for their proper performance. Hospital plans are expected to cover in-patient and out-
patient hospital services associated with the provision of acute, rehabilitative and chronic care. As 
regards physician services, the range of insured services generally encompasses medically 
required services rendered by licensed medical practitioners as well as surgical-dental procedures 
that require a hospital for proper performance. Services rendered by other health care 
practitioners, except those required to provide necessary hospital services, are not subject to the 
Act's criteria.

Within these broad parameters, provinces, along with medical professionals, have the prerogative 
and responsibility for interpreting what physician services are medically necessary. As well, 
provinces determine which hospitals and hospital services are required to provide acute, 
rehabilitative or chronic care.

Universality

The intent of the Canada Health Act is to ensure that all bona-fide residents of all provinces be 
entitled to coverage and to the benefits under one of the twelve provincial/territorial health care 
insurance plans. However, eligible residents do have the option not to participate under a 
provincial plan should they elect to do so.

The Agreement on Eligibility and Portability provides some helpful guidelines with respect to the 
determination of residency status and arrangements for obtaining and maintaining coverage. Its 
provisions are compatible with the Canada Health Act.

I want to say a few words about premiums. Unquestionably, provinces have the right to levy taxes 
and the Canada Health Act does not infringe upon that right. A premium scheme per se is not 
precluded by the Act, provided that the provincial health care insurance plan is operated and 
administered in a manner that does not deny coverage or preclude access to necessary hospital 
and physician services to bona-fide residents of a province. Administrative arrangements should 
be such that residents are not precluded from or do not forego coverage by reason of an inability 
to pay premiums.

I am acutely aware of problems faced by some provinces in regard to tourists and visitors who 
may require health services while travelling in Canada. I will be undertaking a review of the 
current practices and procedures with my Cabinet colleagues, the Minister of External Affairs, and 
the Minister of Employment and Immigration, to ensure all reasonable means are taken to inform 
prospective visitors to Canada of the need to protect themselves with adequate health insurance 
coverage before entering the country.

In summary, I believe all of us as Ministers of Health are committed to the objective of ensuring 
that all duly qualified residents of a province obtain and retain entitlement to insured health 
services on uniform terms and conditions.

Portability

The intent of the portability provisions of the Canada Health Act is to provide insured persons 
continuing protection under their provincial health care insurance plan when they are temporarily 
absent from their province of residence or when moving from province to province. While 
temporarily in another province of Canada, bona-fide residents should not be subject to out-of-
pocket costs or charges for necessary hospital and physician services. Providers should be 
assured of reasonable levels of payment in respect of the cost of those services.

Insofar as insured services received while outside of Canada are concerned, the intent is to 
assure reasonable indemnification in respect of the cost of necessary emergency hospital or 



physician services or for referred services not available in a province or in neighbouring 
provinces. Generally speaking, payment formulae tied to what would have been paid for similar 
services in a province would be acceptable for purposes of the Canada Health Act.

In my discussions with provincial/territorial Ministers, I detected a desire to achieve these 
portability objectives and to minimize the difficulties that Canadians may encounter when moving 
or travelling about in Canada. In order that Canadians may maintain their health insurance 
coverage and obtain benefits or services without undue impediment, I believe that all provincial/
territorial Health Ministers are interested in seeing these services provided more efficiently and 
economically.

Significant progress has been made over the past few years by way of reciprocal arrangements 
which contribute to the achievement of the in-Canada portability objectives of the Canada Health 
Act. These arrangements do not interfere with the rights and prerogatives of provinces to 
determine and provide the coverage for services rendered in another province. Likewise, they do 
not deter provinces from exercising reasonable controls through prior approval mechanisms for 
elective procedures. I recognize that work remains to be done respecting inter-provincial payment 
arrangements to achieve this objective, especially as it pertains to physician services.

I appreciate that all difficulties cannot be resolved overnight and that provincial plans will require 
sufficient time to meet the objective of ensuring no direct charges to patients for necessary 
hospital and physician services provided in other provinces.

For necessary services provided out-of-Canada, I am confident that we can establish acceptable 
standards of indemnification for essential physician and hospital services. The legislation does not 
define a particular formula and I would be pleased to have your views.

In order that our efforts can progress in a co-ordinated manner, I would propose that the Federal-
Provincial Advisory Committee on Institutional and Medical Services be charged with examining 
various options and recommending arrangements to achieve the objectives within one year.

Reasonable Accessibility

The Act is fairly clear with respect to certain aspects of accessibility. The Act seeks to discourage 
all point-of-service charges for insured services provided to insured persons and to prevent 
adverse discrimination against any population group with respect to charges for, or necessary use 
of, insured services. At the same time, the Act accents a partnership between the providers of 
insured services and provincial plans, requiring that provincial plans have in place reasonable 
systems of payment or compensation for their medical practitioners in order to ensure reasonable 
access to users. I want to emphasize my intention to respect provincial prerogatives regarding the 
organization, licensing, supply, distribution of health manpower, as well as the resource allocation 
and priorities for health services. I want to assure you that the reasonable access provision will 
not be used to intervene or interfere directly in matters such as the physical and geographic 
availability of services or provincial governance of the institutions and professions that provide 
insured services. Inevitably, major issues or concerns regarding access to health care services 
will come to my attention. I want to assure you that my Ministry will work through and with 
provincial/territorial Ministers in addressing such matters.

My aim in communicating my intentions with respect to the criteria in the Canada Health Act is to 
allow us to work together in developing our national health insurance scheme. Through continuing 
dialogue, open and willing exchange of information and mutually understood rules of the road, I 
believe that we can implement the Canada Health Act without acrimony and conflict. It is my 
preference that provincial/territorial Ministers themselves be given an opportunity to interpret and 
apply the criteria of the Canada Health Act to their respective health care insurance plans. At the 
same time, I believe that all provincial/ territorial Health Ministers understand and respect my 
accountability to the Parliament of Canada, including an annual report on the operation of 
provincial health care insurance plans with regard to these fundamental criteria.



Conditions

This leads me to the conditions related to the recognition of federal contributions and to the 
provision of information, both of which may be specified in regulations. In these matters, I will be 
guided by the following principles:

1. to make as few regulations as possible and only if absolutely necessary;

2. to rely on the goodwill of Ministers to afford appropriate recognition of Canada's role 
andcontribution and to provide necessary information voluntarily for purposes of 
administering the Act and reporting to Parliament;

3. to employ consultation processes and mutually beneficial information exchanges as the 
preferred ways and means of implementing and administering the Canada Health Act;

4. to use existing means of exchanging information of mutual benefit to all our governments.

Regarding recognition by provincial/territorial governments of federal health contributions, I am 
satisfied that we can easily agree on appropriate recognition, in the normal course of events. The 
best form of recognition in my view is the demonstration to the public that as Ministers of Health 
we are working together in the interests of the taxpayer and patient.

In regard to information, I remain committed to maintaining and improving national data systems 
on a collaborative and co-operative basis. These systems serve many purposes and provide 
governments, as well as other agencies, organizations, and the general public, with essential data 
about our health care system and the health status of our population. I foresee a continuing, co-
operative partnership committed to maintaining and improving health information systems in such 
areas as morbidity, mortality, health status, health services operations, utilization, health care 
costs and financing.

I firmly believe that the federal government need not regulate these matters. Accordingly, I do not 
intend to use the regulatory authority respecting information requirements under the Canada 
Health Act to expand, modify or change these broad-based data systems and exchanges. In order 
to keep information flows related to the Canada Health Act to an economical minimum, I see only 
two specific and essential information transfer mechanisms:

1. estimates and statements on extra-billing and user charges;

2. an annual provincial statement (perhaps in the form of a letter to me) to be submitted 
approximately six months after the completion of each fiscal year, describing the respective 
provincial health care insurance plan's operations as they relate to the criteria and 
conditions of the Canada Health Act.

Concerning Item 1 above, I propose to put in place on-going regulations that are identical in 
content to those that have been accepted for 1985-86. Draft regulations are attached as Annex I. 
To assist with the preparation of the "annual provincial statement" referred to in Item 2 above, I 
have developed the general guidelines attached as Annex II. Beyond these specific exchanges, I 
am confident that voluntary, mutually beneficial exchange of such subjects as Acts, regulations 
and program descriptions will continue.

One matter brought up in the course of our earlier meetings, is the question of whether estimates 
or deductions of user charges and extra-billing should be based on "amounts charged” or 
"amounts collected." The Act clearly states that deductions are to be based on amounts charged. 
However, with respect to user fees, certain provincial plans appear to pay these charges indirectly 
on behalf of certain individuals. Where a provincial plan demonstrates that it reimburses providers 
for amounts charged but not collected, say in respect of social assistance recipients or unpaid 



accounts, consideration will be given to adjusting estimates/deductions accordingly.

I want to emphasize that where a provincial plan does authorize user charges, the entire scheme 
must be consistent with the intent of the reasonable accessibility criterion as set forth on page 6.

Regulations

Aside from the recognition and information regulations referred to above, the Act provides for 
regulations concerning hospital services exclusions and regulations defining extended health care 
services.

As you know, the Act provides that there must be consultation and agreement of each and every 
province with respect to such regulations. My consultations with you have brought to light few 
concerns with the attached draft set of Exclusions from Hospital Services Regulations.

Likewise, I did not sense concerns with proposals for regulations defining Extended Health Care 
Services. These help provide greater clarity for provinces to interpret and administer current plans 
and programs. They do not alter significantly or substantially those that have been in force for 
eight years under Part VI of the Federal Post-Secondary Education and Health Contributions Act 
(1977). It may well be, however, as we begin to examine the future challenges to health care that 
we should re-examine these definitions.

This letter strives to set out flexible, reasonable and clear ground rules to facilitate provincial, as 
much as federal, administration of the Canada Health Act. It encompasses many complex matters 
including criteria interpretations, federal policy concerning conditions and proposed regulations. I 
realize, of course, that a letter of this sort cannot cover every single matter of concern to every 
provincial Minister of Health. Continuing dialogue and communication are essential.

In conclusion, may I express my appreciation for your assistance in bringing about what I believe 
is a generally accepted concurrence of views in respect of interpretation and implementation. As I 
mentioned at the outset of this letter, I would appreciate an early written indication of your views 
on the proposals for regulations appended to this letter. It is my intention to write to you in the 
near future with regard to the voluntary information exchanges which we have discussed in 
relation to administering the Act and reporting to Parliament.

Yours truly,
Jake Epp
Minister of Health
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